o P 05 |
AR BID TABULATION SHEET
FINANCE nermmiﬁﬁpnocunmsm DIVISION

IFB NAME: ROAD MATERIALS
IFB NO.: 16-46 ) CUTTING EDGE
VULCAN MATERIALS | MATERIAL DELIVERY
DUE DATE: February 24, 2017 COMPANY INC. dba MDI ROCK | CURBING SAND AND
CONTRACT ANALYST: Eimer Garcia RGEK
em emeam | UNITOF EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. DESCRIPTION CRIANTTTY MEASURE | UNITPRICE | EXVENDED PRICE} UMIT PRICE PRICE UNIT FRICE PRICE
@ @ (AxB) ) {axs) ) @axel
5.1 |Hot Mix Asphalt, 3/8” Fine Dense Grade | _ 500 |  Ton S0l s _BS,oooho No Bid No Bid NA NA
5,2 |Hot Mix Asphah, %° Fine Dense Grade 80D Ton . wsoli;_s_nym No Bid No Bid NA NA
_5.3_|Hot Mix Asphait, % Fine Dense Grade 400 Ton $63.00{ ¢ 2520000F NoBid No Bid NA NA
_54_|Hot Mix Asphalt, Sand Seal 150 Ton $72001 ¢ . 10800001 Mo Bid No Bid NA NA
5.5_|Cold Mix Patch Asphalt 1200 Ton__§ 49000 wm $ 10500 $ 12600000  NA NA
Asphalt Delivery Price to the City of A ' e .
Glendale Per Ton (Minimum of 24 tons IR
5.5_]on defivery) 800 Ton $700]$  S60000FS 2000} $ 8000.00 NA NA
Sub-Total (ttem No. 5.1 through 5.6) $ 23640000 $ 134,000.00 $0.00
5.7 _|ABCBockil 18500 | Ton ssas|s wosmsools  sools 10800000  sisvsl $ataeson
5.g_{sand (Washed) 600 Ton grn00) s 6ooooo)s 1sools spoooo|  smys| $11250.00
5o (Asphatt Millngs (SSA) 1w Ton NA Na_ B¢  700(s zs000) wA NA
Base Material Defiwery Price to the City .
of Glendale per Ton {Minimum of 24 tons
5.10 |on delivery) 600 Ton $5.2518 33500008 100015 600000 $10.75) __$6,450.00
Sub-Total {item No. 5.7 through 5.10)] S 8002500 § 123,280.00 $230,325.00
GRAND TOTAL| 3316,425.00]  3257,280.00] _ $230,325.00
» ] L 3




