
  

ITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

(A)
5-Gallon 

Container (B) (A X B) (B) (A X B) (B) (A X B) (B) (A X B) (B) (A X B) (B) (A X B) (B) (A X B)

5.1

Latex Paint, Flat, white 
and tints. PPG brand or 
equivalent. 120 Can $110.63 $13,275.60 $97.87 $11,744.40 $69.40 $8,328.00 No Bid No Bid $149.00 $17,880.00 $83.85 $10,062.00 $69.45 $8,334.00

5.2

Latex Paint, Semi-gloss, 
white or tints. PPG 
brand or equivalent

86 Can $122.48 $10,533.28 $109.08 $9,380.88 $74.40 $6,398.40 No Bid No Bid $169.24 $14,554.64 $88.59 $7,618.74 $181.15 $15,578.90

5.3

Lacquer Thinner, utility 
grade. Klean-Strip brand 
or equivalent. 10 Can $11.48 $114.80 $11.48 $114.80 $51.75 $517.50 $49.98 $499.80 $69.11 $691.10 $55.38 $553.80 $69.34 $693.40

    

 $23,923.68 $21,240.08 $15,243.90 $499.80 $33,125.74 $18,234.54  $24,606.30

*

 

IFB TITLE:  GRAFFITI PAINT AND OTHER PAINT SUPPLIES

CARL'S ACE 
HARDWARE  

OPTION 2

DUNN EDWARDS CORPORATION  is deemed to be the lowest responsible and responsive bidder whose bid conforms in material respects to the requirements and criteria set forth in the 
Invitation for Bids.

 

DUNN EDWARDS 
CORPORATION

PAINTERS SUPPLY & 
DECORATING

PPG 
ARCHITECTURAL 

FINISHES INC.

BID TABULATION SHEET

Award is recommended to:    DUNN EDWARDS CORPORATION (Includes Price Sheet Items 5.1, 5.2, 5.3, 5.4 and 5.5)

FINANCE DEPARTMENT/MATERIALS MANAGEMENT

IFB NO.: 16-47 CARL'S ACE 
HARDWARE  

OPTION 1

DUE DATE:  July 25, 2016

CONTRACT ANALYST:  Elmer Garcia

GRAND TOTAL AMOUNT (Items 5.1 through 
5.3)

CONSTRUTION 
TOOL & SUPPLY

GRAINGER

Award Determination

NOTE: * Incomplete price sheet. Deemed non-responsive. 


	IFB 16-47 Bid Tab Sheet

