BID TABULATION

5.1 FIREFIGHTER TURNOUT GEAR
FDC RESCUE PRODUCTS
ltemn No Est. Qnty Unit Description Unit Price | Ext. Amount
' (A) escriptio (B) (AXB)
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HELMET
5.1.1 150 Each NO BID
Mfg/Model:
5.1.2 150 Each TURNOUT COATS NO BID
Mfg/Model:
5.1.3 150 Each TURNOUT PANTS NO BID
Mfg/Model:
5.1.4 200 Pair STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING GLOVES NO BID
Mfg/Model:
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HOODS
5.1.5 800 | Each o - $ 36.68|$ 29,344.00
Mfg/Model: _Majestic PAC Il 23"_
516 100 Pair STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS - NO BID
HONEYWELL BT5007
5.1.7 100 Pair STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS - NO BID
GLOBE SHADOW™
~ |STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS -
5.1.8 100 Pair BLACK DIAMOND X2 S 284.00|S 28,400.00
5.1.9 125 5 Gall. [TURNOUT SOAP/CITROSQUEEZE NO BID
GRAND TOTAL (ltems 5.1.1 through 5.1.9) $ 57,744.00
L.N. CURTIS & SONS
tern No Est. Qnty Unit Descriotion Unit Price Ext. Amount
1 @ ' 'PH (B) (AXB)
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HELMET .
5.1.1 150 Each Non-compliant product
Mfg/Model: Bullard FX
TURNOUT COATS
5.1.2 150 Each NO BID
Mfg/Model:
TURNOUT PANTS
5.1.3 150 Each NO BID
Mfg/Model:
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING GLOVES
5.1.4 200 Pair S 69.50 | S 13,900.00
Mfg/Model: Shelby 5280(G)
5.1.5 800 Each STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HOODS Non-compliant product
Mfg/Model: PGl 3049298
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS -
5.1.6 100 Pair S 384.50|S 38,450.00
HONEYWELL BT5007
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS -
5.1.7 100 Pair S 355.10)S 35,510.00
GLOBE SHADOW™
_ STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS —
5.1.8 100 Pair BLACK DIAMOND X2 NO BID
5.1.9 125 5 Gall.|TURNOUT SOAP/CITROSQUEEZE S 110.00)S 13,750.00
GRAND TOTAL (ltems 5.1.1 through 5.1.9) $ 101,610.00




BID TABULATION

|5.1 FIREFIGHTER TURNOUT GEAR
UNITED FIRE EQUIPMENT
ltemn No Est. Qnty Unit Description Unit Price | Ext. Amount
' (A) escriptio (B) (AXB)
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HELMET .
5.1.1 150 Each ) Non-compliant product
Mfg/Model: Cairns 660C FD* - Color
TURNOUT COATS Mfg/Model:
512 | 150 | Each | g/Mode $1,381.34 | $ 207,201.00
Lion/Super Deluxe CSTM
TURNOUT PANTS
5.1.3 150 Each . S 940.16] $ 141,024.00
Mfg/Model: Lion/V-Force PVFM/F
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING GLOVES
5.1.4 200 Pair |Mfg/Model: Lion Ace Commander|$ 72.50|$ 14,500.00
LPG928BK
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HOODS
5.1.5 800 Each - $ 4350 ($ 34,800.00
Mfg/Model: Majestic/C6 PAC Ill-23
. |STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS -
5.1.6 100 Pair NO BID
HONEYWELL BT5007
. |STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS -
5.1.7 100 Pair NO BID
GLOBE SHADOW™
518 100 Pair STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS — NO BID
o BLACK DIAMOND X2
5.1.9 125 5 Gall. [TURNOUT SOAP/CITROSQUEEZE S 128.00|S 16,000.00
GRAND TOTAL (ltems 5.1.1 through 5.1.9) $ 413,525.00
UNITED FIRE - TOTAL AWARDI $ 348,225.00
WESTERN STATES FIRE
ltern No Est. Qnty Unit Descriotion Unit Price Ext. Amount
1w ' Pt (8) (AXB)
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HELMET
5.1.1 150 Each NO BID
Mfg/Model:
5.1.2 150 Each TURNOUT COATS NO BID
Mfg/Model:
TURNOUT PANTS
5.1.3 150 Each NO BID
Mfg/Model:
5.1.4 200 Pair STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING GLOVES NO BID
Mfg/Model:
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING HOODS
5.1.5 800 Each NO BID
Mfg/Model:
516 100 Pair STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS - NO BID
HONEYWELL BT5007
. |STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS -
5.1.7 100 Pair NO BID
GLOBE SHADOW™
~ [STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING BOOTS -
5.1.8 100 Pair BLACK DIAMOND X2 S 288.00|S 28,800.00
5.1.9 125 5 Gall. [TURNOUT SOAP/CITROSQUEEZE NO BID
GRAND TOTAL (Items 5.1.1 through 5.1.9) $  28,800.00
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