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BID TABULATION SHEET

FINANCE DEPARTMENT/MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
IFB NAME: STREETLIGHT POLES AND ARMS

IFB NO.: 15-52 ..
Southwest Fabrication .
DUE DATE: January 22, 2015 LLC Cem-Tec Corporation
CONTRACT ANALYST: Elmer Garcia
Item |Estimated| unitof Extended Extended
No. |Quantities| Measure Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
(A) (8) (AXB) (8) (AXB)
STEEL POLES AND MASTS
Mast Arm, 3’ Radius, Luminary Support, SRP
4.1.1 8 EACH |[Residential, Spec A-1 $50.00 $400.00|| $55.00 $440.00
Wr\nast Arm, 6’ Radius, Luminary Support, SRP
4.1.2 5 EACH [lArterial, Spec A-2 $72.00 $360.00" $82.00 S41o.oo]|
llzllast Arm, 6’ x 1’8", Luminary Support, Spec
4.1.3 17 EACH -3 $62.00 $1,054.00" $60.00 $1,020.00
Mast Arm, 8’ x 3’, Luminary Support, APS,
4.1.4 2 EACH [ISpec A-4 $71.00 $142.00§ $64.00 $128.00||
Mast Arm, 8 x 3’, Luminary Support, APS,
4.1.5 1 EACH |[Spec A-4, painted dark bronze $77.00 $77.00|| $75.00 $75.00"
Mast Arm, 8’ x 8’, Luminary Support, APS, "
4.1.6 6 EACH ||Spec A-5 $93.00 $558.00 $88.00 $528.00
Mast Arm, 12’ x 8’, Luminary Support, || II
4.1.7 8 EACH traight 3-Bolt Shoe Spec A-6 $122.00 $976.00| $160.00 $1,280.00
Mast Arm, 4’3" x 8’, Luminary Support, Spec
4.1.8 1 EACH [la-7 $77.00 $77.oo|| $122.00 5122.00"
4.1.9 1 EACH |{Mast Arm, 18", Luminary Support, Spec A-8 $40.00 $40.00|| $68.00 568.00||
Mast Arm, 8’ x 3’, Luminary Support, for Steel
4.1.10 10 EACH |[Pole on Breakaway Base $71.00 sno.oo" $64.00 $640.00||
4.1.11 1 EACH "Mast Arm, 20’ 3-Bolt Plate, Modified G $195.00 $195.00|| $260.00 5260.00"
4.1.12 1 EACH ||High Rise Mast Arm for wood poles $111.00 $111.00" $152.00 $152.00"
Hand Hole Cover, 3” x 5” Galvanized " ||
4.1.13 56 EACH [[Rectangle, for poles P-1, P-3, P-5, P-8 $6.50 $364.00f $5.00 $280.00
Hand Hole Cover, 3” x 6” Rectangle with " "
4.1.14 5 EACH [|Cleat $6.50 $32.50( $10.00 $50.00
IlHand Hole Cover, 3” x 5” Rectangle, Black, for| || "
4.1.15 5 EACH {|P-2 Pole $6.50 $32.50] $7.00 $35.00
Hand Hole Cover, 3” x 5.5” Flat Oval with " Il
4.1.16 27 EACH [|Cleat $6.50 $175.50] $5.00 $135.00
Hand Hole Cover, 3” x 5.5” Flat Oval with II 0"
4,1.17 1 EACH [[Cleat, Painted Black $6.50 $6.50[ $7.00 $7.0
Hand Hole Cover, 7.5” x 5.25" Galvanized Flat " "
4.1.18 2 EACH {lOval with Cleat $6.50 $13.00| $25.00 $50.00
Hand Hole Cover, 4” x 6” Galvanized, “ "
4.1.19 45 EACH Contoured, for P-7 Pole $6.50 $292.50 $5.00 $225.00
4.1.20 4 EACH [[Hand Hole Cover, 5” x 7.5” Galvanized Oval $6.50 SZG.O(J $15.00 SG0.00I'
Pole, Luminary Support on 22’ on
4.1.21 40 EACH [fFoundation, Spec P-1 $379.00 $15,160.00|l $492.00 | $19,680.00||




Pole, Luminary Support W/ Arm on
Foundation, 6” Square x 29’ 6” Black, Split

4,1.22 10 EACH [ICover, Spec P-2 $720.00 $7,200.00| $786.00 $7,860.00)
Pole, Luminary Support on 30.5’ Direct Bury, "
4.1.23 150 EACH [|SpecP-3 $325.00 $48,750.00] $329.00 S49,350.00n
Pole, Luminary Support 4” Square x 34’ Black
4.1.24 50 EACH Direct Bury, Spec P-4 $350.00 $17,500.00|| $393.00 $19,650.00ll
Pole, Luminary Support on 31’ Direct Bury,
4.1.25 25 EACH IISRP Arterial, Spec P-5 $298.00 $7,450.00|| $356.00 $8,900.00]|
Pole, Residential Post Top, 23’ 6” Black,
4.1.26 25 EACH [|Direct Bury, Spec P-6 $163.00 $4,075.00" $212.00 $5,300.00||
lPoIe, Luminary Support, 38’ 6” Black, Direct
4.1.27 20 EACH [Bury, Arterial, Spec P-7 $438.00 $8,760.00J|i508.00 $10,160.00"
Pole, Luminary Support 30'6” Direct Bury,
4,1,28 1 EACH |ISpec P-3, Painted Dark Bronze $366.00 5366.00" $362.00 5362.00"
Pole, Luminary Support 22’ on Foundation,
4.1.29 1 EACH |[Modified for Traffic Signal Base, Spec P-8 $434.00 $434.00" $589.00 $589.00||
Pole, Luminary Support 22’ on Foundation,
4.1.30 1 EACH |[[Double Mast Arms for Medians, Spec P-9 5428.00 $428.00" $588.00 $588.00]|
Pole, Luminary Support 16’3” on Foundation,
4.1.31 1 EACH |G Pole {(Modified P-1) $401.00 $401.00|I $571.00 $571.00"
Pole, Luminary Support 30’ on Foundation,
4.1.32 1 EACH |5pec P-10 $475.00 $475.00|| $663.00 $663.00
“Pole, Luminary Support 38'6”  Direct Bury,) " II
4.1.33 1 EACH [ISpec P-11 $471.00 $471.00|| $558.00 $558.00
Steel Pole with Breakaway Base, Luminary
4.1.34 10 EACH [[Support 27’ on Foundation $872.00 $8,720.00|| 5416.00 $4,160.00"
Base Cover for Round Pole, square shape.
4.1.35 2 EACH [|(See Exhibit 5.30) $27.00 $54.00 $25.00 $50.00
Base Cover for Round Pole, square shape
4.1.36 2 EACH |[with rounded edges (See Exhibit 5.31) $54.00 $108.00" $50.00 $100.00|I
Base Cover for P2 Pole, square shape, black
4,1.37 15 EACH |lcolor (See Exhibit 5.32) $27.00 $405.00" $40.00 $600.00"
Base Cover for P1 Pole, round shape (See
4.1.38 15 EACH [[Exhibit 5.33) $27.00 S405.00|| $37.00 $555.00||
Sub-Total (Item 4.1.1 through 4.1.38) $126,804.50|| $135,661.00|I
NON-STEEL POLES AND ARMS
Shakespeare or approved equivalent
aluminum Mast Arm 4’ x 12’, Luminary
4.1.39 10 EACH |[Support No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shakespeare or approved equivalent]
fiberglass Pole Luminary Support 33, Direct
4.1.40 10 EACH [|Bury No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shakespeare hand hole cover for fiberglass
post top poles, Part No. 37-75-0038-60 or
approved equivalent. Black color;
approximate dimensions: 5” vertical, 4.5”
diagonal, and 2.5” horizontal. (See Exhibit
4.1.41 2 EACH 5.28) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




hakespeare hand hole cover for fiberglass
post top poles, or approved equivalent.

pproximate dimensions: 5.5” vertical, 4.75"
diagonal, and 3” horizontal. (For Grand

4.1.42 2 EACH venue fiberglass poles.) (See Exhibit 5.29) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sub-Total (Iltem 4.1.39 through 4.1.42) $0.00 $0.00
GRAND TOTAL POLES AND MASTS (ltem 4.1.1 through 4.1.42) $126,804.50 $135,661.00

Award Determination

Award Is recommended to: SOUTHWEST FABRICATION LLC (items 4.1.1 through 4.1.38)

SOUTHWEST FABRICATION LLC is determined to be the lowest, responsible and responsive bidder whose bid conforms in all material
&respect to the requirements and criteria set forth in the Invitation for Bids.

Concurrence by Department: WMM( W M/&/\

Name and Title: Mike Sills-Traush, Programs Admin. Engineering

Date: A~ 1215




